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	Ein cyf / Our ref:     287/18/FOI



You asked us:
1. Could you provide me with details of all laptops, phones, tablets, computers and USB sticks which have either been lost or stolen during the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018 to date?

2. For each incident please provide details of the item, whether it was lost or stolen and, if possible, how it became lost/stolen e.g. house break-in.

3. For each incident, please provide whether the incident was recorded as a potential personal data breach.
4. Information on which department the device belonged to.
Our Response:
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) staff are required to record all incidents onto an IT system (Datix) against predefined categories.  The categorisation of incidents is subject to interpretation by the person reporting the incident or inputting the data.  Provided in the spreadsheet embedded below are details of incidents recorded under the category ‘proven, alleged or suspected theft within the Information Technology’ together with incidents identified from a financial loss search for the years requested.  Please note however that there was no factual evidence recorded on Datix to suggest that there was theft in any of the cases referred to.  
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Datix listing report

		Year		Unit		Item		Incident		Data Breach

		2017		Ysbyty Glan Clwyd Hospital - Acute		Handheld casenote scanner		Item missing when arrived into work		No

		2018		Ysbyty Gwynedd - Acute		Blank USB sticks		On arrival envelope had been opened		No

		2016		Mental Health - Heddfan Adult Unit, Wrexham Maelor Hospital		Laptop		Missing from drawer		Not recorded

		2018		Offices		Mobile Phone		Lost		Not recorded

		2018		Wrexham Maelor Hospital - Acute		Mobile Phone		Missing after annual leave		Not recorded

		2016		Ysbyty Glan Clwyd Hospital - Acute		Mobile Phone		Lost		No

		2016		Mental Health Community Services		Mobile Phone		Lost		Not recorded

		2018		Mental Health Community Services		Mobile Phone		Missing after left on charge		Not recorded






